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What foods can improve liver health?

Your liver is the organ responsible for an enormous number of metabolic activities, and
you'll need a plentiful supply of virtually all nutrients for your liver to be optimally
healthy. In general, fruits and vegetables would be at the top of our list in the support
category, since they contain such a wide range of nutrients that participate in liver
function. Additionally, if you are focused on liver health, it is important to consume
foods that are organically grown; the liver is an organ that detoxifies chemicals and
therefore with organically grown foods you'll reduce your exposure to agricultural
chemicals. In this same toxic exposure category, moderate consumption of alcohol (or
less) would also be important to the health of your liver, since this organ postpones
other important functions when it is trying to metabolize excess alcohol.

Fried foods and other high-fat foods (like processed foods containing hydrogenated oils)
would also be particularly hard on your liver. Just as with alcohol, there is a limit to the
total amount of fat than your liver can process while maintaining all of its other
metabolic activities.

There are a couple of food groups that would also be especially helpful in supporting
your liver's ability to detoxify chemicals. First are foods rich in sulfur. Sulfur-containing
compounds are one of the primary types of molecules used to help the liver detoxify a
wide range of prescription medications, pesticides, and other types of environmental
toxins. Foods in this category would include onions, garlic, and egg yolks. (We'd caution
against overconsumption of egg yolks, however, due to their higher concentration of
cholesterol and saturated fat. Two-to-four eggs per week would be a very reasonable
amount for most persons). Some additional sulfur-containing foods are worth
mentioning as a category of their own - namely, the cruciferous vegetables. There are
some unique sulfur compounds in these foods that may be especially beneficial in liver
detoxification processes. Foods in this group include broccoli, cabbage, cauliflower,
collard greens, kale, and Brussels sprouts.

To support your liver's immune function, we also feel obligated to mention some
culinary spices that have extensive research with respect to their role in liver support.
Those spices include turmeric, cinnamon, and licorice.



According to the American Liver Foundation here are some additional ways to keep
your liver healthy:

Eat a well balanced, nutritionally adequate diet. If you enjoy foods from each of the four
food groups, you will probably obtain the nutrients you need.

Cut down on the amount of deep-fried and fatty foods you and your family consume.
Doctors believe that the risk of gallbladder disorders (including gallstones, a liver-
related disease) can be reduced by avoiding high-fat and cholesterol foods.

Minimize your consumption of smoked, cured and salted foods. Taste your food before
adding salt! Or try alternative seasonings in your cooking such as lemon juice, onion,
vinegar, garlic, pepper, mustard, cloves, sage or thyme.

Increase your intake of high-fiber foods such as fresh fruits and vegetables, whole grain
breads, rice and cereals. A high-fiber diet is especially helpful in keeping the liver
healthy.

Rich desserts, snacks and drinks are high in calories because of the amount of
sweetening (and often fat) they contain. Why not munch on some fruit instead?

Keep your weight close to ideal. Medical researchers have established a direct
correlation between obesity and the development of gallbladder disorders.

For more information on this topic, see:

Broccoli
[Brussels sprouts
[Cabbage
[Cauliflower
[Cinnamon
[Collard greens
[Eggs, hen
[Garlic
[Kale
[Onions
[Turmeric, ground

References:

http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=9
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=10
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=19
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=13
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=68
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=138
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=92
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=60
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=38
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=45
http://whfoods.com/genpage.php?tname=foodspice&dbid=78


Fukao T, Hosono T, Misawa S, et al. Chemoprotective Effect of Diallyl Trisulfide From
Garlic Against Carbon Tetrachloride-Induced Acute Liver Injury of Rats.
Biofactors;2004;21(1-4):171-4.

Kasinath, RT, Joseph PK, Hebron K, et al, 1997). The Effects of Garlic Oil Upon Serum
Indicators of Liver Function. Biochem Soc Trans. 1997;25(3):533S.

Keck AS, Qiao Q, Jeffery. EH. Food Matrix Effects on Bioactivity of Broccoli-Derived
Sulforaphane in Liver and Colon of F344 Rats. J Agric Food Chem. 2003;51(11):3320-7.

Parcell, S. Sulfur in Human Nutrition and Applications in Medicine. Altern Med Rev.
2002;7(1): 22-44.

Perocco P, Bronzetti G, Canistro D, et al. Glucoraphanin, the Bioprecursor of the Widely
Extolled Chemopreventive Agent Sulforaphane Found in Broccoli, Induces Phase-I
Xenobiotic Metabolizing Enzymes and Increases Free Radical Generation in Rat Liver.
Mutat Res.2006; 595(1-2):125-36.

Vang O, Frandsen H, Hansen KT, et al. Biochemical Effects of Dietary Intakes of
Different Broccoli Samples. I. Differential Modulation of Cytochrome P-450 Activities in
Rat Liver, Kidney, and Colon. Metabolism. 2001;50(10):1123-9.


